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paperback. Book Condition: New. Ship out in 2 business day,
And Fast shipping, Free Tracking number will be provided after
the shipment.Pages Number: 519 Publisher: Electronic Industry
Pub. Date :2011-5-1. Book is practical from an engineering
point of view. by a large number of typical examples. layman's
language and multi-axis CNC machining of mastercamx4
processes. methods and techniques. Mastercamx4 based multi-
axis CNC machining with a typical example of a total of 13.
Chapter 1 ~ 5 describes mastercamx4 multi-axis machining
techniques. including multi-axis CNC machining expertise.
mastercam processing operation and setup. multi-axis milling.
turning and wire Cutting these commonly used techniques; 6 to
13 from shallow to deep to arrange a large number of
examples of mastercam multi-axis machining. milling.
including two-dimensional. three-dimensional milling. five-axis
milling. turning. multi-axis milling machining. 2 axis of the
cutting. 4 axis cutting. multi-axis engraving process. Instance
type of rich. wide coverage. representativeness. according to
entry - to improve - the classic gradual approach. in line with
the reader learning process. learn to understand. Even if the
reader had no foundation. it can quickly get started and
improved. All instances of all from the front line practice. and
practical application of strong. giving top priority...
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